
Subject: Re: South Park Cash Disbursements & Possible Funds Transfer
From: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>
Date: 06/08/2017 02:28 PM
To: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>, Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>

Yes please. Thanks.

From: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>
Date: Thursday, June 8, 2017 at 2:28 PM
To: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>, Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Subject: RE: South Park Cash Disbursements & Possible Funds Transfer

Ellen:

Do you want me to transfer funds per Marcus’ suggestion below?

Thanks

Bob

Robert Buente

President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation

1001 South Hope Street

First Floor

Los Angeles, CA  90015

bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org>

213-749-0214 x202 (o)

213-749-3098 (f)

From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Thursday, June 8, 2017 2:22 PM
To: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>; Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>
Subject: Re: South Park Cash Disbursements & Possible Funds Transfer

Bob,

Any chance you can approve invoices today?

Thanks,

Ellen

From: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com <mailto:Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com> >
Date: Thursday, June 8, 2017 at 9:45 AM
To: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> >, Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org> >
Subject: South Park Cash Disbursements & Possible Funds Transfer

Bob,

SP & SPII invoices are ready for your review.

Ellen,  the balance of the debit card account is $2,780.   Do you think Bob should transfer $5K so we’ll be set for a while?
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Thank you,

Marcus Lieber
Supervising Senior
Business Management

ArmaninoLLP <http://http/armaninollp.com>
11766 Wilshire Blvd., Ninth Floor | Los Angeles, CA 90025
(310) 478-4148 x5794 main | (310) 703-1227 fax

From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Thursday, June 8, 2017 7:50 AM
To: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com <mailto:Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com> >
Cc: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org> >
Subject: Re: Bills uploaded

Hi Marcus,

Are you able to review and invoice today? Would like to close this out this week. 

Thanks

Ellen

-----

Ellen Riotto

Interim Executive Director 

South Park BID

1100 S Flower St, Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

o. 213-663-1112

c. 401-439-8147

24/7: 866-560-9346

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 5, 2017, at 2:35 PM, Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> > wrote:

Hi Marcus,

Hope you’re doing well! FYI bills have been uploaded and are ready for your review. NOTE: there is one for SPII.

Thanks,

Ellen

Ellen Riotto 

Interim Executive Director
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South Park Business Improvement District

1100 S Flower St, Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la>  | o. 213 663 1112 | c. 401 439 8147

southpark.la <https://na01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.southpark.la%2F&
data=02%7C01%7CMarcus.Lieber%40armaninoLLP.com%7C0462e2f1f23d488c72d408d4ae7db463%7C5e8a5341629d44219dbff5a5224ce6e7%7C0%7C0%7C636325302310368640&
sdata=zp6l8d7aP%2B0GizFYznE1EzDEclA8LP7qb2SqKLV3hcg%3D&reserved=0>  | Facebook <https://na01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F
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%2Ffb.com%2FSouthParkLosAngeles&
data=02%7C01%7CMarcus.Lieber%40armaninoLLP.com%7C0462e2f1f23d488c72d408d4ae7db463%7C5e8a5341629d44219dbff5a5224ce6e7%7C0%7C0%7C636325302310368640&
sdata=DzeV0KaFIB%2BVHZZ05xgKAhY%2F9SYC7D90Ns2phjW%2F8mI%3D&reserved=0>  | Twitter <https://na01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F
%2Ftwitter.com%2Fsouthparkla&
data=02%7C01%7CMarcus.Lieber%40armaninoLLP.com%7C0462e2f1f23d488c72d408d4ae7db463%7C5e8a5341629d44219dbff5a5224ce6e7%7C0%7C0%7C636325302310368640&
sdata=ZQPqe%2FGIo9vDHr9S1xO7zJagrl5Kxr7x5EgKVnlfigE%3D&reserved=0>  | Instagram <https://na01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F
%2Fwww.instagram.com%2Fsouthparkla%2F&
data=02%7C01%7CMarcus.Lieber%40armaninoLLP.com%7C0462e2f1f23d488c72d408d4ae7db463%7C5e8a5341629d44219dbff5a5224ce6e7%7C0%7C0%7C636325302310368640&
sdata=GIEUk%2FGUwcy9eTmP5v6z3UqOwGd%2BIquE9gKlU10fl6Y%3D&reserved=0>

24/7 DISPATCH: 866-560-9346
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:
This communication, including attachments, is for the exclusive use of the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential, 
proprietary and/or privileged information. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, 
this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you received this by mistake, please contact the 
sender immediately.
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